
Exit the Karak Highway immediately after Genting Sempah 
Tunnel at Exit 803. This takes you across the highway past 
the Petronas petrol station onto the old Bentong Road. Follow 
the road until you come to a large arch with 'Janda Baik’ 
across the top. Turn right there and drive for 1km then turn 
right into  Tanarimba Janda Baik. Sign in at the guardhouse. 
Follow the road uphill for 2.5km then turn right into Persiaran 
Enderong. Proceed until you come to the sign 'Kebun 
Organic'  and a small waterfall and gate.

Exit the Karak Highway at the turn off signposted Janda Baik / 
Kg Bukit Tinggi. Turn right and go through the highway 
underpass. Turn right again past shophouses into Kg Bukit 
Tinggi. Bear left uphill past fruit stalls and a police station 
until you come to a T-Junction at the top of the hill. You will 
see 'Kg Janda Baik' in huge white letters. Make a right then 
immediately sharp left through the arch with 'Janda Baik’ 
across the top. Drive for 1km then turn right into Tanarimba 
Janda Baik. Sign in at the guardhouse. Follow the road uphill 
for 2.5km then turn right into Persiaran Enderong. Proceed 
until you come to the sign 'Kebun Organic' and a small 
waterfall and gate.
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You may take either of the following routes:map 

call 09-233-0194

Lot 161 Tanarimba Janda Baik, Persiaran Enderong, Bukit Tinggi. Bentong 28750. Pahang
a little farm on the hill




